CODE

CITY OF REDMOND
ORDINANCE NO. 2729

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF REDMOND,
WASHINGTON, AMENDING RMC CHAPTERS 15.04,
FLOOD CONTROL; 15.08, BUILDINGS AND
CONSTRUCTION; RMC CHAPTER 15.12, ELECTRICAL
CODE; RMC CHAPTER 15.14, MECHANICAL CODE;
RMC 15.16, PLUMBING CODE; RMC 15.18, ENERGY
CODE, TO UPDATE THE CITY’S BUILDING AND
CONSTRUCTION CODES TO REFLECT CURRENT STATE
STANDANDS; AND REPEALING RMC CHAPTER 15.10,
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, AND RMC CHAPTER
15.20, VENTILATION AND INDOOR AIR QUALITY
CODE, IN THEIR ENTIRETY

WHEREAS, RCW 19.27.031 mandates that all c¢ities use and
enforce the State Building Code adopted by the State Building
Code Council; and

WHEREAS, effective July 1, 2013, the State Building Code
Council has adopted the 2012 Editions of the Internatiocnal
Building Code, International Residential Code, International
Mechanical Code, and Uniform Plumbing Code; and

WHEREAS, RCW 15.27A.20 mandates that all cities use and
enforce the current versions of the Washington State Energy Code
adopted by the State Building Code Council; and

WHEREAS, RCW 19.28.010 mandates that all cities use the
current versions c¢f the Naticnal Electrical Code adopted by the

State of Washington; and

Page 1 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No, 14-034



WHEREAS, the Building Code provides a method to address
unsafe building and structures and the Department of Planning
and Community Development desires to wuse Building Code and
repeal the International Maintenance Code; and

WHEREAS, the State Building Code Council has repealed the
Washington State Indoor Air Quality Code and is no lﬁnger in
effect.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF REDMOND,
WASHINGTON, DO ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Classification, This ordinance 1is of a

general and permanent nature and shall become a part of the City

Code.

Section 2. Amendment of Section. RMC Chapter

15.04.060, Flood Control, is hereby amended to read as follows:

15.04.060 Administration and enforcement.

The Building Official shall administer and implement

this chapter by granting, granting with conditions, or
denying buillding pérmit applications in accordance
with its provisions. Administration and enforcement of
the provisions o<f this chapter sghall be the same as

provided in the [UNIEFORM BOILDING-CODRE] BUILDING CODE

as adopted and amended in RMC Chapter 15.08,

Page 2 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No., 14-034



Section 3. Rrendment of Chapter. RMC Chapter 15.08,

Buildings and Construction, i1s hereby amended to read as
follows:

Chapter 15.08

BUILDING CODE*

Sections:

15.08.010 Short title.

15.08.020 Adoption.

15.08.030 Public inspecticn.

15.08.040 Deleticns.

15.08.050 Amendments to the International Building

Code.
15.08.060 Amendments to the International Residential

Code.

15.08.070 Ccmplete application for permit.
15.08.080 Penalties for wviolations.
15.08.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute
the ™Building Code” of the City and may be cited as
such.

15.08.020 Adoption.

The International Building Code, [286€] 2012 Edition,
published by the International Code Council, with the
additions, deletions and exceptions as set forth in
Chapter 51-50 of the Washington Administrative Code

and the International Residential Ceode, [20686] 2012

FEdition, published by the Internaticnal Code Council,

Page 3 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No., 14-034



with the additions, deleticns and exceptions as set
forth in Chapter 51-51 of the Washington
Administrative Code, are Thereby adopted by this
reference and incorporated herein as if set forth in
full as the Building Code for the City, except such
portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by
this chapter.

The Building Official may use the appendices for
guidance in interpreting and administering the
Building Code and the provisions of this chapter.
Further, the following appendix chapters are

specifically adopted.
International Building Code:
Rppendix I, Patic Covers.
International Residential Code:
Appendix A, Sizing and Capacities
of Gas Piping; except
for liguefied

petroleum gas

installations;

Appendix B, Size of Venting

Systems Serving

Page 4 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



Appliances Equipped
with Draft Hoods,
Category 1 Appliances
and Appliances Listed
for Use and Type B

Vents;

Appendix C, Exit Terminals of
Mechanical Draft and
Direct-Vent Venting

Systems;

Appendix G, Swimming Pools, Spas

and Hot Tubs; and

Appendix H, Patio Covers.

15.08.030 Public inspection.

The City shall at all times keep on file with the
City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not
less than cone copy of the codes and resolutions, or
parts  thereof, as herein adopted by reference,
together with the amendments and supplements thereto
herein made a part of this chapter.

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the

City Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in

Page 5 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



order to make them more readily available for
inspection and use by the general public.
15.08.040 Deletions.

The following sections of the Internatiocnal Building
Code, [(2666] 2012 Rdition, are hereby deleted:

1. Section [+#2] 113 - Board of Appeals.

2. Bection 105.1.1 - Annual Permit.

3. Section 105.1.2 - Annual Permit Records.

4. Secticn 101.4.4 — Property Maintenance.

The following sections of the International
Residential Code, [266€] 2012 Edition, are hereby
deleted:

1. Secticn R112 - Board of Appeals.

2. Chapters 11 and 25 through [4Z2—WAC—S50—51—-003)]

43 (WAC 51-51).

15.08.050 Amendments +to the International Building
Code.

The following secticons of the International Building
Code adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to
read as follows:

1. Amend Section 101i.1, Title.

Page 6 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



These regulations shall be known as the “Building Code
of the City of Redmond,” hereinafter referred to as
“this code.”

2. Amend Section 101.4, Referenced Codes.
The other codes listed 1in Secticons 101.4.1 through
101.4.6 and referenced elsewhere in this code shall be
considered part of the requirements of this code to

the prescribed extent c¢f each such reference.

[101-4-1 ELECTRICAL— THE—PROVISIONS —OF —THE—NATIONAL

[10L-4-2] 101.4.1 Gas. The provisions of the
Internaticnal Fuel Gas Code as adopted in Chapter

15.14 RMC shall apply to the installation of gas

piping from the pcint of delivery, gas appliances and
related accessories as covered in this code. These
requirements apply to gas piping systems extending
from the point of delivery to the inlet connections of

appliances and the installation and operation of

Page 7 of 64 Ordinance No

AM No.

. 2729
14-034



residential and commercial gas appliances and related
accessories.

[161-4-3] 101.4.2 Mechanical. The provisiocns of the
International Mechanical Code as adopted in Chapter
15.14 RMC shall apply to the installation, alteration,
repair and replacement of mechanical systems,
including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings
and/or appurtenances, including ventilating, heating,
cocling, air-conditioning and refrigeration systems,
incinerators and other energy-related systems.

[101-4-4] 101.4.3 Plumbing. The provisions of the
Uniform Plumbing Cede as adopted in Chapter 15.16 RMC
shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair
and replacement of plumbing systems, including
equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and
appurtenances, and where connected to a water or
sewage system and all aspects cf a medical gas system.
The provisions of the State of Washington requirements
for private sewage dispeosal shall apply to private

sewage disposal systems.

101.4.4 Property Maintenance is not adopted

Page 8 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No, 14-034



101.4.6 Fire Prevention,. The provisions of the

International Fire Code as adopted in Chapter 15.06
RMC shall apply to matters affecting or relating to
structures, processes and premises from the hazard of
fire and explosion arising from the storage, handling
or use of structures, materials or devices; from
conditions hazardous to life, property or public
welfare in the occupancy of structures or premises;
and from the construction, extension, repair,
alteration or removal of fire suppression and alarm
systems or fire hazards in the structure or on the
premises from occupancy or operation.

101.4.7. Energy. The provisions of the Washington

State FEnergy Code as adopted in Chapter 15.18 RMC [AMNB

Page 9 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



AR —COoBE—AS—ADORTEL—IN—GHARTER I 5-20—RME] shall

apply to all matters governing the design and
construction of buildings for energy efficiency.

3. Amend Section 105.2, Work exempt from permit.
Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall
not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to
be done in any manner in vioclation of the provisions
of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this
jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the
following:

Building:

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as
tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar uses,
provided the flocr area dces not exceed 200 square
feet (18.58 m?2).

2. PFences not over [€] 7 feet (1,829 mm) high.

3. Repealed by Ord. 2452.

4. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1,219
mm) in height measured from the bottbm of the footing
to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge
or impounding Class I, IT or III-A liquids.

5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the

capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallens (18,925 L)} and

Page 10 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No, 14-034



the ratio of height to diameter or width does not
exceed 2 to 1.

6. Sidewalks, driveways and detached decks not more
than 30 inches (762 rmm) above adjacent grade and not
over any basement or story below and are not part of
an accessible route.

7. Painting, papering, tiling, <carpeting, cabinets,
counter tops and similar finish work,

8. Temporary moticn picture, television and theater
stage sets and scenery.

9. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group
R-3 occupancy, as applicable in Section 101.Z, which
are less than 24 incheg (610 mm) deep, do not exceed
5,000 gallons (18,925 L) and are installed entirely
akbove ground.

10. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or
agricultural purposes and not including service
systems.

11. Swings and other playvground equipment accessory to
detached one- and two-family dwellings.

12. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which
do not project more than 54 inches (1,372 mm) from the

exterior wall and do not require additiocnal support of

Page 11 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



Group R-3, as applicakle in Section 101.2, and Group U
occupancies.

13. Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks,
counters and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches
(1,753 mm} in height.

Electrical:

Repairs and maintenance: Class A Basic Electrical Work
as defined in RCW 19.28.006¢.

Radio and television transmitting stations: The
provisions of this code shall not apply to electrical
eguipment used for radio and television transmissions,
but do apply to equipment and wiring for power supply,
the installations of towers and antennas.

Electrical and telecommunications utility companies:
The provisions o¢f this code shall not apply to
electrical and telecommunications utility companies as
specified in RCW 192.28 and WAC 296-46B.

Gas:

1. Portable heating appliance.

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter
approval of equipment or make such egquipment unsafe.
Mechanical:

1. Portable heating appliance.

Page 12 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM MNo. 14-034



2. Portable ventilation equipment.

3. Portable cocling unit.

4. Bteam, hot or c¢hilled water piping within any
heating or cooling equipment regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any part which does not alter its
approval or make it unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative cooler.

7. BSelf-contained refrigeration system containing 10
pounds (4.54 kg} or less of refrigerant and actuated
by motors of 1 horsepower {746 W) or less.

Plumbing:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste
or vent pipe provided, however, that if any concealed
trap, drain plpe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe
becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove
and replace the same with new material, such work
shall be considered as new work and a permit shall be
obtained and inspecticn made as provided in this code.
2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks
in pipes, valves or fixtures, and the removal and
reinstallation cof water closets, provided such repairs
do not involve or require the replacement or

rearrangement of wvalves, pipes or fixtures.

Page 13 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



4. Amend Section [#88-2], 109.2 Schedule of Permit
Fees.

On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical
and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a
permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as
reguired, in accordance with Redmond Zoning Code
Section 21.76.030, Application Requirements, as said
gection currently exists or 1s hereafter amended,
modified or recodified.

5. Amend Section [#08+4] 109.4, Work Commencing
Before Permit Issuance.
Any person who commences any work on a building,
structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing
system before cbtaining the necessary permits shall be
subject to a special investigation fee. The
investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the
permit fee that would be required by this code if a
permit were to be 1issued. An investigation fee, in
addition to the permit fee, may be collected whether
or neot a permit is then or subsequently issued. The
payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any
person from compliance with all other provisions of

this code, nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

Page 14 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No., 14-034



Ialp]
I

COMD A RS
AT B B W B i

LELE S
T TILY

OVNT Y in R TOOTIR Y LILTA
AT PN i g =

QAT T
TR LTI

P LTINS
OO L OIN T

21729

Ordinance No.

Page 15 of 64

14-034

AM No.



SHALLTNOT BE REFUNDED

7. [AMENB] Add Section [H2] 113, Means of Appeal.
Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by
the Building 0Official related te the application or
interpretation c¢f this ccde shall be made pursuant to
Redmond Zoning Code Section 21.76.060(I), Appeals of
Type I and II Permits, as said section currently
exists or is hereafter amended, modified or
recodified.

The provisions of this section shall not preclude the

Building 0Official from convening a Code Adviscry Body

comprised of members who are qualified by experience

Page 16 of 64 Ordinance No

AM No,

. 2729
14-034



and training to pass on matters pertaining to building

construction.

8. Amend Section 116.3 Notice. If an unsafe condition

is found, the building official shall serve on the

owner, agent or person in control of the structure as

provided in RMC Section 15.08.080, Enforcement and

Penalties.

[&=] 8. Amend Section [115.4] 116.4, Method of
Service.
The notice and order and any amended or supplemental

notice and/ecr order shall be served [URPON—THE RECORD

OWNER—AND—POSTED—ON—CHE—PRGEERTY] as provided in RMC

Section 15.08.080, Enforcement and Penalties. {FHE

Page 17 of &4 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



Page 18 of 64 Crdinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



Page 19 of 64

Ordinance No.

2729

AM Mo, 14-034



RAM TR
T e

TR DR T OMTIIT
N T vV T

P s

L1520 MITAITTRE S
T | 3 np A w vy

HATR
TIOoGIS

Ty
U

2729
14-034

No.

Ordinance

Page 20 of 64

AM No.



Page 21 of 64 Crdinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



BV

s . .
. 2 W
sssssiann i A ; 5
= Fa L T

—

.
1y

§ o)
Fan)

9&9““‘*” +*Aly

FEINDAGE W

wwﬁw

Figure 504.4
AREAS ALLOWING TYPE V § STORY
WOOD FRAME CONSTRUCTION

Crtoher 2005

Page 22 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



TR
i iy e

A DT T TIOMAL

on1

QLM T AR
[y ==

M T
TTETVY

A
YL

11
pi

T T T T I TR T

i~ ~ar e g

TN

>

2729
14-034

No.

Ordinance

Page 23 of 64

AM No.



Page 24 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



CANNOT BE—REARIEY—CHANGED ]

15.08.060 Amendments to the International Residential ;
Code.
The following sections of the Internaticnal
Residential Code adopted by this chapter are hereby
amended to read as follows:
1. Amend Section R101.1, Title.
These provisicns shall be known as the “Residential
Code for One—- and Two-Family Dwellings of the City of
Redmond,” and shall be cited as such and will be

referred to as “this code.”

2. Amend Section R10Z.4, Referenced «codes and
standards.
Page 25 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729

AM No, 14-034



The referenced c¢odes and standards shall be as

specified in Section 101.4 of the amended
administrative provisions of the International
Building Code, Section 15.08.050, Redmond Municipal
Code.

3. Amend Secticn R105.2, Work exempt from permit.
Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall
not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to
be done in any manner in viclation of the provisions
of this ccde or any other laws or ordinances of this
jurisdiction., Permits shall not be required for the
following:

Buiiding:

1. One-story detached accessory structures, provided
the floor area deoces not exceed 200 square feet (18.58
m2j.

2. Fences not over [£] 7 feet (1,829 mm) high.

3. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1,219
mm) 1in height measured from the bottom of the footing
to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.
4. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the

capacity deces not exceed 5,000 gallons (18,925 L) and

Page 26 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



the ratio of height to diameter or width doces not
exceed 2 to 1.

5. Sidewalks, driveways, and detached decks not more
than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent grade and not
over any basement or stery below.

6. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets,
counter tops and similar finish work.

7. Prefabricated swimming pcols that are less than 24
inches (610 mm) deep.

8. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to
a one- or two-family dwelling.

9. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which
do not project more than 54 inches (1,372 mm) from the
exterior wall and do not reguire additional support.
10. TLight weight rcof covering. Light weight roof
covering includes composition, or metal roof covering,
and similar materials where the installed unit weight
is less than 4 pounds per square foot.

11. Removal and replacement of interior doors in
existing docr frames.

12. Removal and replacement of exterior windows in

existing window openings. The size of opening may not

Page 27 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



be altered and operable opening size may not be
decreased.

Electrical:

Repairs and maintenance: A permit shall not be
required for Class A Basic Electrical Work as defined
in RCW 19.28.006.

Gas:

1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying
appliances.

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter
approval of equipment or make such equipment unsafe.

3. Portable fuel «cell appliances that are not
connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

Mechanical:

1. Portable heating appliance.

2. Portable ventilation equipment.

3. Portable cooling unit.

4. B8Bteam, hot or chilled water piping within any
heating or ccoling equipment regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any part which dcoes not alter its
approval or make it unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative cooler.

Page 28 of 64 Ordinance No, 2729
AM No. 14-034



7. Self-ceontained refrigeration system containing 10
pounds (4.54 kg) or less of refrigerant and actuated
by motors of 1 horsepower (746 W) or less.
8. Portable fuel «cell appliances that are not
connected to & fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.
Plumbing:
1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste
or vent pipe provided; however, that if any concealed
trap, drain pipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe
becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove
and replace the same with new material, such work
shall be considered as new wcrk and a permit shall be
obtained and inspectiocn made as provided in this code.
2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks
in pipes, valves or fixtures, and the removal and
reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs
de not invelve or require the replacement or
rearrangement of valves, pipes cor fixtures.

4, Amend Section R108.2, Schedule of permit fees.
On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical
and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a

permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as

Page 29 of 64 Ordinance No. 272%
AM No. 14-034



required, in accordance with the Redmond Zoning Code
21.7¢, as said secticon currently exists or is
hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

5. Amend Section R108.5, Refunds.
The building official shall authorize the refunding of
fees Dbased on [ AMENBES] administrative provision
[SEETFFEoN—308-6] of the International Building Code,

RMC 15.08[+858].

6. [ABPP—NEW] Amend Section R108.6, Work commencing
before permit issuance.
Any person who commences any work on a building,
structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing
system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be
subject to a spaecial investigation fee. The
investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the
permit fee that would be required by this code if a
permit were to be issued. An investigation fee, in
addition to the permit fee, may be collected whether
or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The
payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any
person from compliance with all other provisions of

this code, nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

FPage 30 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



7. [(AMEND] Add Section R112Z, [APPEALS] Means of

AEEeal.

Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by
the Building 0Official related to the application or
interpretation cf this ccde shall be made pursuant to
Redmond Zoning Code Secticn 21.76.060(I), Appeals of
Type I and II Permits, as salid section currently
exists or is hereafter amended, modified or
recodified.

8. Add new Secticn R301.1.4, Auvtcomatic Fire Sprinkler
System Requirements for Townhouses.
All townhouse buildings with an aggregate area of all
connected townhcuses equaling or exceeding 5,000
square feet or greater shall comply with the
requirements of the Redmond Fire Code, as adopted in
Chapter 15.06 RMC for automatic fire sprinkler
systems.

9. Amend Table R301.2(1), Climatic and Geographic
Design Criteria.
Grouqd Snow Lead = 15 [BS] psf
Wind Speed = 85 mph

Topographic effects = NO

Seismic Design Category = D2

Page 31 of 64 Ordinance No

AM No.

. 27729
14-034



Subject to Damage From

Weathering = Mcderate

Frost Line Depth = 12"

Termite = Slight to Moderate

Decay = Slight to Moderate

Winter Design Temp. = 27 degrees F
Ice Shield Underlayment Reguired = No
Flood Hazards = Jocined National Flood .Insurance
Program 1979

Current Flecod Hzzard Map - FIRM 1999
BAir Freezing Index = 113

Mean Annual Temp. = 32 degrees F

10. Add Section R11l5 Unsafe Structures and Equipment

Unsafe structures and equipment are subject to the

provisions for unsafe structures and equipment as

provided in RMC 15.08.050, amended Section 116 of the

International Building Code.

15.08.070 Complete application for permit.
Determination of whether a building permit
application is complete for purposes of administering
Redmond Zoning Code Chapter 21.76, Review Procedures,
shall be made by the Building Official and shall be

based upon the adopted building codes.

Page 32 of 64 Ordinance No, 2729
AM No. 14-034



Enforcement and

[EENALTIES—FOR—VIOLATIONS]

15.08.080

Penalties.

f this code or

ision o

Any person who viclates a prov

fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof,

QOfficial shall be

at the disgcretion of the Building

1n

[

subject to the enforcement and penalties provided

RMC Chapter 1.,14.

ML
LA i i

ralin
L =

DRI
ey B e

I T LT
L I o ¥

(CURITYT T
L i i P

My
Ly

B TT
[ o Y P )

alalininl fain
L ) L

MilT o
TIiLlw>

OR
L

My

O

DIREBCmMmTIrT

NOCTIIMBE RIS AL
OO TN Ty i s

IO QMDD T T ARY

A DDDAIITTN
Fan % T A i g

T 11T

N

N

~ALK

ey |

AL B A

CRDPMT TR MY
It M P P L g v g

REDMT T OR
TTY

i om e i g g

iy
X

ralp]
iy

OREETOTAT
R g = e

DRITTT T h
[ g i p e i

nL
P g

SITAT T
WL LT

C O™
gy

Ty

L L

Al
L

PROLLT QT AN
LR AR " g e mp e iy )

g e

M

N RR
SN TFLILYT

TOQTILTY
[y sy

0
P M v e s s s

DA |

L i v

Thl

DROITNEL 'R
ALY

TINOVY T DO

) RERNAT T T

QIR TRom My ML

WL

L

L

g i g . g e e P s

LS LU LT

E

TIZYT W

CIHIDPRERANMT % YT omo

L I R A IR B E e

[N S L NS M W A )

1.4 TRMAMN NN DA T QM T AN
SR S Ay g ¥ S 0 W B

1

AR _CIITA DT
TN —CTIZTD L LOLNC

Maintenance

RMC  Chapter 15.10, Property

4.

Section

.
-+

ty to read as follows

lre

Ts ent

in 1

is hereby repealed

Code,

JH U N N R i

10Nl A_QuApm mTmT m
LT LU O T Py

N

THhIC DRI T YT
TINA Lo L NS

100 020 PRt T

1B

P g e e

L e T L e Y

2729

Ordinance No.

Page 33 of 64

14-034

No.

AM



Page 34 of 64

Ordinance No.

2729

AM No. 14-034



L L

Tl

4

1
=y

AR QLA T VKT
TILITTIVEG o how L LT

S il s g ey

LA L e Tl

hAY

hi)

-

2729

Ordinance No.

Page 35 of 64

14-034

AM No.



2729
14-034

No.

Ordinance

Page 36 of 64

AM No.



Page 37 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



IARTAY Y
Ty

falalnin
gy =y

MmIIT o
[ I ey )

fay= 110 OE
LN [ it W L

QM T VAT 100G
Ea

[T S m

O
v

DROILT O T ANG
PO AR " e iy

i
T Iy

[ELERE

DEMAOT T T AN

it e it g e e
LTI
i

faNs]
TIY
TT
P R P P i

DRI
1TV

[ L ik i s e s 2y

RERATD

Falnl ML Iri/ainhrd O
L LT LILT UARE Y 3 oL
OLIRTT DR DADT
[ M T e g [ o i R AV v g e

ORRETOT AT

CAMPT M T OW]
RS it I B i i e

CONE
ST

ML,
T ITLT
TR
T ITIT

PONTE

irtfalink’s

MAMAT (eyam

FiS VAR
IV

TDERT 7 B

VISALNLY ALY LTy

mon
L LTET

[aanl
v

JE I Ry . i §

= mp w4 I

THR
LI

PIIRT T(COAMT AR
T ITINy

LR NP 1 s oy

ML falalsaliil falinl
TV LIIY i A e T

CONTILD

T
T

[sEsNATANENAYA)
LUETRT AT e vy

L

D MAOLINT DR
DTN T

MITE oyam

AR
TSN I

MO T OO
A A R By o e

AN QDN I O R DT T
= r=rn T

LN

REOMAD YT R

S

JELI N iy |

1T T

A T |

[V R up W g i )

M
Ty

O
T

BY—rHE—cE T Y—EN—THE— GO R RCTION

0

(IR B By

THNAOTIRRE N

ATY

On

TG
e

CEDITAMrTD T

TSI T 1T TR BILTT I TA— MR
s A g e T R

AR IAY.Y
T

DDADLIPYF

TN

[ PR Wt

ALY

LI i A )

T

YTLI L

[ R S s P i A

o

myrpg

O R
oL

AN D O O O
Y SRS A W e w iy

¥isl Y Am)
TN

MNAMB D

mLm
8 A o e

6 S A

TN

FAN.N AR

TOOATER
EE Ay my

LAZ XL

arn o

2729

Ordinance No.

Page 38 of 64

14-034

AM No.



Page 39 of 64 Ordinance No, 2729
BM No. 14-034



T
i

TETA RN =0

T
=g g

AT T
p o v

fak
=)

DDA O
AL A TIN LTI WY

{90
7

IRYnralelnlnisl il
[ T

LT

LYY

Y Faanl
N T

27729
14-034

No.

Ordinance

Page 40 cof 64

AM No.



1 14 DM o QN TN (el rfaliarayy CIIRRERMT W BY.ITamaog fals] T

L LT 1.\].]\.;, 1 T [ - gy mv g [P 5 = b W gy | LN T M P N i Mgy e J LY LS
HEREAFTER—AMENDED—MOEIFIED OR RECODI IR ]

Section 5. RMC  Chapter 15.12, Flectrical Code, is

hereby amended to read as focllows:
Chapter 15.12

ELECTRICAL CODE¥

Sections:

15.12.010 Short title.

15.12.020 Adoption.

15.12.030 Public inspectiocon.
15.12.040 Deletions.

15.12.050 Amendments.

15.12.060 Penalties for viclations.

15.12.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute
the “Electrical Code” of the City and may be cited as
such.

15.12.020 Adoption.
The National Electrical Code (NFPA 705, [266>] 2008

Edition and effective July 1, 2014, the 2014 edition,

published by the National Fire Protection Association,

Page 41 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



with the additicns, deleticns and exceptions as set
forth in Chapter 296-46B WAC is hereby adopted by this
reference and incorporated herein as 1f set forth in
full as the Electricai Code for the City, except such
portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by
this chapter.

The Building Cfficial may use the annexes for
guidance in interpreting and administering the
Electrical Cocde and the provisions of this chapter.
Further, the following annex chapters are specifically
adopted:

Annex A, Product Safety Standards;

Annex B, Application Information for Ampacity
Calculatiocon; and

Annex C, Cenduit and Tuking Fill Tables for
Conductors and Fixture Wires of the Same Size.
15.12.030 Public inspection.

The City shall at all times keep on file with the
City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not
less than one copy of the codes and resolutions, or
parts thereof, as herein adopted by reference,
together with the amendments and supplements thereto

herein made a part of this chapter.

Page 42 of 64 Ordinance No. 2728
AM No. 14-034



The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the
City Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in
order to make them more readily available for
inspecticn and use by the general public.

15.12.040 Deletions.

The following sections of the Natiocnal Electrical
Code, [2985] 2008 Fdition, are hereby deleted:

1. Article 80 - Administration and Enforcement.

The following sections of WAC Chapter 296-46B,
Electrical Safety Standards, Administration and
Installation, are hereby deleted:

2. References to fees in [WAG—296-46B-505—206-46R—

SIH0—and—206—46RB-011] WAC 296-46B-906, 296-46B-908,

296-46B—-909, 296-46B-911 and 296-46B-915.

3. Electrical Board-Appeal Rights and hearings in

WAC 296-46B-985.

15.12.050 Amendments.

The following secticons of the National Electrical
Code adcpted by this chapter are hereby amended to
read as follows:

1. Add new Section 90.4(A), Administration.

Page 43 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



The amended administrative provisions of the
International Building Code, Section 15.08.050 Redmond
Municipal Code, shall apply.

2. Add new Section 90.4(B), Basic Electrical Work.
The Basic Electrical Work definition and
classificaticn as specified in RCW 19.28.006.

3. Add new Section 90.4(C), Inspections,

The installaticon, alteration or extensicn of any
electrical system, fixtures or components for which an
Electrical Permit 1is reguired by this Code shall be
subject to inspection by the Building Official and
such electrical systems, fixtures and components shall
remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes
until approved by the Building Official. It shall be
the duty of the permit applicant to cause the
electrical systems to remain accessible and exposed
for inspection purposes. The City shall not be liable
for any expense entailed in the removal or replacement
of material required tc permit inspection. Electrical
systems and edquipment regulated by the National
Electrical Code shall not be connected to the energy
source or energized until authorized by the Building

Cfficial.

Page 44 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No., 14-034



4. Add new Section 90.4(D), Special Inspections.

The Building Official may require special inspection
of equipment or wiring methods where the installation
requires special training, equipment, expertise,
knowledge, or other such factors. Where such special
inspection 1s required, an independent third party
acceptable to the Building Official shall perform it.
The special inspection person/agency shall be
designated and approved ©prior to beginning the
installation of wiring or equipment. The Building
Official pricr te the installation being approved
shall receive a written report from the designated
special inspection agency indicating that the
installation conforms to the appropriate Codes and
standards. All cecsts for such testing and reporting
shall be the responsibility of the permit holder.

5. Add new Section 9C.4(E), Unused Conductors.
Electrical conductors not in use shall be removed
unless otherwise authorized by the Building Official.

6. Add new Section 90.4(F}), Corrections.

If, upon inspection, any installation is found not to
be fully in conformity with this Code, the Building

Official shall at once forward to the person, firm, or

Page 45 of 64 . Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



corporation making the installation a written notice
stating the defects that have been found to exist.
Correction of these defects shall be made within 15
days.

7. Add new Section 90.4(G), Approval of Violations.
Approval &s a result of an inspection shall not be
construed to be an approval of a wviolation of the
provisions of the Natiocnal Electrical Code or other
laws or ordinances of the City. Inspections presuming
to give authority to viclate or cancel provisions of
the National Electrical Ccde or other laws or
ordinances of the City shall not be wvalid.

8. Add new Section 210.52(G)(3), Electric Vehicle
Charging.

Where an applicant propeoses to install a battery
charging station for electric wvehicles in a garage
serving a one or two-family dwelling, a one-inch,
trade-size conduit shall ke installed and terminated
in a 4 11/16 x 2 1/8 trade size box. The box shall be
installed in the wall and be a minimum of two feet
from the panelboard. The Dbox shall be permanently
labeled to read “Electric Vehicle Charging Only.” A

two-pole space shall be dedicated in the panel and

Page 46 of 64 Ordinance No

AM No.

. 2729
14-034



shall be labeled "“Electric Vehicle Supply Equipment.”
Nothing in this section shall be construed as
mandating that a battery charging station be installed
in every one and two-family dwelling, provided, that
in the event the Washington State Electrical Code is
amended to reguire such installation, the provisions
of this section shall kecome mandatory and shall apply
to all such installations.

15.12.060 Penalties for violations.

Any person who violates a provision of this code or
fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a
building or structure electrical system in wviolation
of the approved construction documents or directive of
the building official, or of a permit or certificate
issued under the provisions of this code, shall be
subject to the penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110
and Chapter 1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists
or 1s hereafter amended, modified or recodified.
Section 6. RMC  Chapter 15.14, Mechanical Code, is

hereby amended to read as fellows:

Page 47 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No, 14-034



Chapter 15.14
MECHANICAL CODE*

Secticons:

15.14.010 Short title.

15.14.020 Adoption.

15.14.030 Public inspection.

15.14,040 Deletions.

15,14.050 Amendments to the International Mechanical
Code,

15.14.060 Amendments to the International Fuel Gas

Code,
15.14,070 Penalties for viclations.

15.14.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute
the “Mechanical Code” of the City and may be cited as
such.

15.14.020 Adoption.

The International Mechanical Code, [2666] 2012
Edition, published by the International Code Council,
with the &additions, deletions and exceptions as set
forth in Chapter 51~-52 WAC and the International Fuel
Gas Code, 2006 Edition, published by the International
Code Council, are hereby adopted by this reference and
incorporated herein as 1f set forth in full as the
Mechanical Code for the City, except such portions as
may be deleted, modified or amended by this chapter;

The Building Official may use the appendices for

guidance in interpreting and administering the

Page 48 of &4 Crdinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



Mechanical Code and the provisions of this chapter.
Further, the following appendix chapters are
specifically adopted.

International Mechanical Code:

None.

International Fuel Gas Code:

Appendix A, Sizing and Capacities
cf Gas Piping; except
for liquefied
petroleum gas
installations;

Appendix B, Size of Venting
Systems Serving
Appliances Equipped

with Draft Hoods,
Category 1 Appliances
and Appliances Listed
for Use and Type B
Vents; and

Appendix C, Exit Terminals of
Mechanical Draft and
Direct-Vent Venting
Systems.

15.14.030 Public inspection.

The City shall at all times keep on file with the
City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not
less than one copy of the codes and resolutions, or
parts thereof, as herein adopted by reference,
together with the amendments and supplements thereto

herein made a part of this chapter.

Page 49 of 64 Ordinance No, 2729
AM No. 14-034



The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the
City Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in
order to make them more readily available for
inspection and use by the general public.

15.14.040 Deletions.

The following sections of the International
Mechanical Code, [Z60€] 2012 Edition, are hereby
deleted:

1. Section 109 - Means of Appeal.

The following sections of the International Fuel Gas
Code, [2886] 2012 Edition, are hereby deleted:

1. Chapter 1 - Administration.

15.14.050 Amendments to the International Mechanical
Code.

The following sections of the International
Mechanical Cecde adcpted by this chapter are hereby
amended to read as follows:

1. Amend Section 101.1, Title,.

These regulations shall be known as the “Mechanical
Code of the City of Redmond,” hereinafter referred to
as “this code.”

2., Amend Section 102.8, Referenced codes and

standards.

Page 50 of 64 Ordinance No

AM No.,

. 2729
14-034



The referenced codes and standards shall Dbe as
specified in Section 101.4 of the amended
administrative provisions of the International
Building Code, Section 15.08.050 Redmond Municipal
Code,

3. 2Amend Section 106.4.1, Approved construction
documents.
When the ccode official issues a permit where
construction documents are regquired, the construction
decuments shall ke approved, in writing or by stamp,
as “Reviewed for Code Compliance.” Such reviewed
construction documents shall not be changed, modified
or altered without authorization from the code
official., Work shall be done in accordance with the
approved construction documents. One set of
construction documents so reviewed shall be retained
by the code official. The other set shall be returned
to the applicant, shall be kept at the site of work
and shall be open to inspection by the codeicfficial
or a duly authorized representative.
The code official shall have the authority to issue a
permit for the construction of part of a mechanical

system before the construction documents for the

Page 51 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



entire system have been submitted or approved,
provided adequate information and detailed statements
have been filed complying with all pertinent
requirements of this code. The holder of such permit
shall proceed at his or her own risk without assurance
that the permit for the entire mechanical system will
be granted.

4. Amend Section 106.5.2, Fee schedule.
A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in
accordance with the Redmond Zoning Code Section
21.76.030(E), as said section currently exists or is
hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

5. Amend Secticn 106.5.3, Fee refunds.
The code official shall authorize the refunding of
fees based on [AMENDED] administrative provision
[SECTEON-—108-6] of the International Building Code,

[SEETEON] Chapter 15.08[+650] Redmond Municipal Code.

6. Amend Section 108.4, Violation penalties.
Any person who viclates a provision of this code or
fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a
building or structure mechanical system jjlhviolation

of the apprcved construction documents or directive of

Page 52 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
BM No. 14-034



the building officisl, or of a permit or certificate
issued under the provisions of this code, shall be
subject to the penalties provided for in Redmond
Municipal Code 1.01.110 and Chapter 1.14 Redmond
Municipal Code, as said section currently exists or is
hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

7. Amend Section 109, Means of Appeal.

Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by
the Building Official related to the application or
interpretaticn of this code shall be made pursuant to
Redmond Zoning Code Section 21.76.060(I), Appeals of
Type 1 and 1II Permits, as sald section currently
exists or is hereafter amended, modified or
recodified.

15.14.060 Amendments to the International Fuel Gas
Code.

The following sections of the International Fuel Gas
Code adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to
read as fcllows:

1. Add new Chapter 1, Administration.

The amended acdministrative provisions of the
International Mechanical Code, Redmond Municipal Code

15.14.050, shall apply.

Page 53 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



15.14.070 Penalties for wviolations.

Any person who violates a provision of this code or

fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who erects, constructs, alters or repailrs a
building or structure mechanical system in wviolation
of the approved construction deocuments or directive of
the Building Official, or of a permit or certificate
issued under the provisions of this code, shall be
subject to the penalties provided for im RMC 1.01.110
and Chapter 1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists
or is hereafter amended, modified or recodified.
Secticn 7. RMC Chapter 15.16, Plumbing Code, is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Chapter 15.16
PLUMBING CODE*

Sections:

15.16.010 Short title.

15.16.020 Adopticn.

15.16.030 Public inspection.
15.16.040 Deletions.

15.16.050 Amendments.

15.16.060 Penalties for wviclations.

15.16.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute
the “Plumbing Code” of the City and may be cited as
such.

15.16.020 Adoption.

Page 54 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No., 14-034



The Uniform Plumbing Code, [2886] 2012 Edition, [AND

THE—UNEEORM—DREUMBING — COBbE— STAND
BOTH] published by the International Association of
Plumbing and Mechanical COfficials, together with the
additions, deletions and exceptions as set forth in
Chapters 51-56 [AND—-I~57—WAE], are hereby adopted by
this reference and incorporated herein as if set forth
in fﬁll as the Plumbing Code for the City, except such
portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by
this chapter.

The Building O©fficial may use the appendices for
guidance in interpreting and administering the
[MESHANLCAL] Plumbing Ccde and the provisions of this

chapter. Further, the fcllowing appendix chapters are

specifically adcpted:

Appendix A, Sizing the Water
Supply System;

Appendix B, Explanatory Notes
on Combination
Waste and Vent
Systems; and

Appendix I, Installation
Standards.

15.16.030 Public inspection.
The City shall at all times keep on file with the

City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not

Page 55 of 64 Ordinance No, 2729
AM No. 14-034



less than one copy of the codes and resolutions, or
parts thereof, as herein adopted Dby reference,
together with the amendments and supplements theretc
herein made a part of this chapter.

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the
City Clerk in the custody of the Building ©Official in
order te make them more readily available for
inspection and use by the general public.

15.16.040 Deletions.

The following sections of the Uniform Plumbing Code,
[2666] 2012 Edition, are hereby deleted:

1. Section 103.4.2 - Plan Review lIees.

2. Table 1-1 ~ Plumbing Permit TFees.

3. Chapters 12 and 15, plus those requirements of the
Uniform  Plumbing Code relating to venting and
combusticn ailr of fuel-fired appliances found in
Chapter & and those portions of the code addressing
building sewers (WAC 51-56-003).

15.16.050 Amendments.

The following secticns of the Uniform Plumbing Code
adopted by this chapter are hereby amended to read as
follows:

1. Amend Section [#62+3+-2] 102.5, Penalties.

Page 56 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



Any person who violates a provision of this code or
fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who erects, censtructs, alters or repairs a
building or structure plumbing system in violation of
the approved construction documents or directive of
the building official, or of a permit or certificate
issued under the provisions of this code, shall bhe
subject to the penalties provided for in Redmond
Municipal Code 1.01.11C and Chapter 1.14 Redmond
Municipal Code, as said section currently exists or is
hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

2. [ABb—¥EW] Amend Section [404+4] 102.3, [APPEALS]

Board of Appeals.

Appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made by
the Building O0fficial related to the application or
interpretation of this codse shall be made pursuant to
Redmond Zoning Code Secticn 21.76.060(I), Appeals of
Type I and II Permits, as said section currently
~exists or is hereafter amended, modified or
recedified.
3. Amend Section [}63-4-%] 103.4, Permit Fees.
A fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in

accordance with the Redmond Zoning Code Section

Page 57 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



21.76.030(E), as said chapter currently exists or is
hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

4. Amend Section [+83+4+5] 103.4.4, Fee Refunds.
Section 108.6 Refunds of the [AMENDBED] administrative
provisions of the International Building Code,

[SBSTESNT Chaptexr 15.08[+858}) Redmond Municipal Code,

shall apply.
15.16.060 Penalties for wviolations.

Any person who violates a provision of this code or
fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a
building or structure plumbing system in violation of
the approved construction documents or directive of
the building official, or of a permit or certificate

issued under the provisions of this code, shall be

subject to the penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110

and Chapter 1.14 RMC, as said section currently exists

or is hereafter amended, modified or recodified.

Section 8. RMC Chapter 15.18, Energy Code, 1is hereby

amended to read as follows:

Page 58 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
BM No. 14-034



Chapter 15.18

ENERGY CODE*

Sections:

15.,18.010 Sheort title.
15.18.020 Adoption.
15.18.030 Public inspection.
15.18.040 Deletions.

15.18.050 Amendments.
15.18.060 Penalties for wviolation.

15.18.010 Short title.

This chapter and amendments hereto shall constitute
the "Energy Code” of the City and may be cited as
such.

15.18.020 Adoption.

The Washington State Fnergy Code, [Z2686] 2012
version, Chapter 51-11 of the Washington
Administrative Code, is hereby adopted by this
reference and incorporated herein as 1if set forth in
full as the Energy Code for the City, except such
portions as may be deleted, modified or amended by
this chapter.

15.18.030 Public inspection.

The City shall at all times keep on file with the
City Clerk, for reference by the general public, not
less than one copy of the codes and resolutions, or

parts thereof, as herein adopted by reference,

Page 59 of 64 Ordinance No,

2729

AM No. 14-034



together with the amendments and supplements thereto
herein made a part of this chapter.

The copies of the codes on file may be placed by the
City Clerk in the custody of the Building Official in
order to make them more readily available for
inspection and use by the general public.

15,18.040 Deletions.

There are nc deletions to the Washington State Energy
Code.

15.18.050 Amendments.

There are no amendments to the Washington State
Energy Code.

15.18.060 Penalties for viclations.

Any person who violates a provision of this code or
fails to comply with any of the reguirements thereof
or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a
building c¢r structure in viclation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the Building
Official, or of a permit or certificate issued under
the provisions of this code, shall be subject to the
penalties provided for in RMC 1.01.110 and Chapter
1.14 RMC, as salid section currently exists or is

hereafter amended, moeodified cr recodified.

Page 60 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



Section 9. RMC Chapter 15.20, Ventilation and Indoor

Air Quality Code, is hereby repealed in its entirety as follows:

-FCHARTER—15-20
VENTELATIOH -AND—INDOCR—ATIR-QUALITY CODE*

Page 61 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



Ly LA
v an g TTIILT

[ = gy y ey

OAMN_TTTL MAS DT DT ACRNY DWW
' I e s Ry A P e it A ! i

AN - i )

gy

U DT OF LIRE S RFLUEATAY Rl nla)

T ITHT o7 L LTLTwns

-y

EN

MU RITTT TN  ARPEBETOTAT

MmIrm ATTQMmMAMmYy O

LI A A

COTms TR E TR

L L L LT

P LW P I i B R )

A i 3 e

AV g ey

TFOTINIT e

L

S Py

Mo, RYW MU ATWNTRAT RIIRT TmM

AN

TAIC DR T AT
[P ' P P B gt i i

P I s v e

LT AT TIN LTI

ST B iy e e

PR YN

RELDATDOQ
EILY il M s e e iy

O
ALY

AT
2 Wi e i

TN T I G = Ty

falal Y Ialii sl aralinia)
oy p=

inApinialiiial
i s

LYY AN
Wiz

OR
IV

ADDDAOYTITT
I TE LIy LT

SMTAOT AM T AT
VI T I

CpIICMmIIRE
[0 B WP N i v e

RIOOTT TR
Tro o I

THE

faln
L

ThnL
LY

o
TN

IR A
SN e e oy e i

ARYAVal iy ink Yl Fain] NDTRECMTIIL OR PELT
[T AL Wl i 8 A e IV | 0w T S e s g i L R

AN

AT Fy e n )

CONCSTDI AT T AR

ININIRY o]
ATl g m

TOQUIRY
ER RS g

CRRMT LT~ M
R g B My e o g P i)

PRDM T FAND]
ALY

LR I i i e e e

il

Faxni
L X

[l

O T TART
LT .LuLnJJ,

VO MELT O ralalnin QLINT T Do Qe Thom LILY A TN LR
Fy § gy Ry = =y [ . o I e e [ZA A ™A=L Ea e P o

T

LTINSy I LI

LR A DDRDOIIT QT AR

e g i o

DRI
T

Al

1

S SR W g s i w

i W I

1

T
gy |

DRMIIT LT

CHADRTL D
AP B I 2 ' e P i

I B0.Y,
TS

EOR
LIS

T INTV T LT

PEMAT DT
i iy 4 P v

27239

Ordinance No.

Page 62 of 64

14-034

AM No,



HS
1a}

a
H
43}
H3
i3}
O

v]
HH
h

H
A

Section 10. Severability., If any section, sentence,

clause or phrase of this ordinance should be held to be invalid
or unconstitutional by a ccurt of competent Jjurisdiction, such
invalidity or unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity
or constituticnality of any other section, sentence, clause or
phrase of this cordinance.

Section 11. FEffective date. This ordinance shall beccme

effective five days after its publication, or publication of a
summary thereof, in the <c¢ity’s official newspaper, or as

otherwise provided by law.

Page 63 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729
AM No. 14-034



ADOPTED by the Redmond City Council this 18" day of

February, 2014,
CITY OF REDMOND
HN MARCHIONE, MAYOR

ATTEST:
MICHELLE M. HART,\MMC, CITY CLERK (SEAL)
APPROVED AS TO FORM:
JAMES GAREY, CITY ATTORNEY
FILED WITH THE CUTY CLERK: February 4, 2014
PASSED BY THE CIT%. CUNCIL: February 18, 2014
SIGNED BY THE MAYOR: February 24, 2014
PUBLISHED: February 24, 2014
EFFECTIVE DATE: March 1, 2014
ORDINANCE NO. 2729
Yes: Allen, Carson, Flynn, Margeson, Myers, Shutz, Stilin
Page 64 of 64 Ordinance No. 2729

AM No. 14-034

—



